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|30| And out of the tribe of 
Asher, Mishal with its 
migrash, Avdon with its 
migrash, 
|31| Chelkat with its migrash, 
and Rechov with its migrash; 
4 towns. 
|32| And out of the tribe of 
Naphtali, Kedesh in the Galil 
with its migrash, to be an Ir 
Miklat HaRotzeiach; and 
Chammmot Dor with its 
migrash, and Kartan with its 
migrash; 3 towns. 
|33| All the towns of the 
Gershuni according to their 
mishpekhot were 13 towns 
with their migrash. 
|34| And unto the 
mishpekhot Bnei Merari, the 
rest of the Levi'im, out of the 
tribe of Zevulun, Yokneam 
with its migrash, and Kartah 
with its migrash, 
|35| Dimnah with its 
migrash, Nahalal with its 
migrash; 4 towns. 
|36| And out of the tribe of 
Reuven, Betzer with its 
migrash, and Yachtzah with 
its migrash, 
|37| Kedemot with its 
migrash, and Mephaat with its 
migrash; 4 towns. 
|38| And out of the tribe of 
Gad, Ramot in Gil`ad with its 
migrash, to be an Ir Miklat 
HaRotzeiach; and 
Machanayim with its migrash, 
|39| Cheshbon with its 
migrash, Yazer with its 
migrash; 4 towns in all. 
|40| So all the towns for the 
Bnei Merari by their 
mishpekhot, which were 
remaining of the mishpekhot 
Levi'im, were by their goral 12 
towns. 
|41| All the towns of the 
Levi'im within the achuzzat 
Bnei Yisroel (possession, estate 
of the Sons of Israel) were 48 
towns with their migrashim. 
|42| These towns were every 
one with their migrash around 
them; thus were all these 
towns. 

|43| And Hashem gave unto 
Yisroel Kol HaAretz which He 
swore to give unto their Avot; 
and they possessed it, and 
dwelt therein. 
|44| And Hashem gave them 
manoach (rest, peace) on every 
side, according to all that He 
swore unto their Avot; and 
there stood not a man of all 
their enemies before them; 
Hashem delivered all their 
enemies into their yad. 
|45| There naphal (failed, 
fell) not davar mikol hadavar 
hatov (any promise from all 
the good promises) which 
Hashem had spoken unto Bais 
Yisroel; hakol bo (all came, all 
came to pass). 

Then Yehoshua 
summoned the 
Reuveni, and the 

Gadi, and the half-tribe of 
Menasheh, 
|2| And said unto them, Ye 
have been shomer over all that 
Moshe Eved Hashem 
commanded you, and have 
obeyed my voice in all that I 
commanded you; 
|3| Ye have not deserted your 
achim these yamim rabbim to 
yom hazeh, but have been 
shomer over the mishmeret 
mitzvat Hashem Eloheichem 
(charge, duty of the 
commandment of Hashem 
your G-d.) 
|4| And now Hashem 
Eloheichem hath given 
manoach unto your achim, 
just as He promised them; 
therefore now return ye, and 
get you unto your ohalim, and 
unto the Eretz Achuz-
zatechem, which Moshe eved 
Hashem gave you on the other 
side of the Yarden. 
|5| But be shomer to do the 
mitzvah and the torah, which 
Moshe Eved Hashem charged 
you, to love Hashem 
Eloheichem, and to walk in all 
the darkhei Hashem (see Ac 
21:21 OJBC), and    

to be shomer mitzot regarding 
His commandments, and to 
have deveykus (attachment, 
cleavimg to G-d) to Him, and 
to serve Him in avodas 
[kodesh] with kol levavchem 
uvkhol nafshechem (all your 
heart , with all your nefesh).  
|6| So Yehoshua gave them a 
berakhah, and sent them 
away; and they went unto 
their ohalim. 
|7| Now to the one half of the 
tribe of Menasheh Moshe had 
given possession in Bashan; 
but unto the other half thereof 
gave Yehoshua among their 
achim on this side Yarden 
westward. And when 
Yehoshua sent them away also 
unto their ohalim, then he 
gave them a berakhah, 
|8| And he spoke unto them, 
saying, Return with nekasim 
rabbin  (many possessions) 
unto your ohalim, and with 
mikneh rav me'od (very much 
cattle), with kesef, and with 
zahav, and with nechoshet, 
and with barzel (iron), and 
with very much selamot 
(clothes); divide the plunder of 
your enemies with your achim. 
|9| And the Bnei Reuven and 
the Bnei Gad and the 
half-tribe of Menasheh 
returned, and departed from 
the Bnei Yisroel at Shiloh, 
which is in Eretz Kana'an, to 
go unto Eretz Gil`ad, to the 
Eretz Achuzzatam 
(the land of their possession, 
estate), whereof they had 
taken as a possession, 
according to the word of 
Hashem by the yad Moshe. 
|10| And when they came 
unto the Gelilot of the Yarden, 
that is in eretz Kena'an, the 
Bnei Reuven and the Bnei 
Gad and the half-tribe of 
Menasheh built there a 
mizbe'ach by the Yarden, a 
mizbe'ach gadol in 
appearance. 
|11| And the Bnei Yisroel 
heard, Hinei,  
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